Jeff King

From: Marc Kolek <mkolek@hotmail.com>
Sent: Friday, January 11, 2013 5:22 PM
To: Jeff King

Subject: Re: Sewer Contractors

I ' will not be making any payment prior to a billing arrangement. Please keep me informed of the next step.

Thanks,

Marx

Sent from my iPhone

On Jan 11, 2013, at 9:28 AM, Jeff King <jking(@massillonohio.com> wrote:

Hey Marc, here’s a copy of the invoice submitted by Holderbaum. Were you planning on making any
type of payment on this bill right know let me know as soon as possible. Thank Jeff

From: Marc Kolek [mailto:mkolek@hotmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, January 03, 2013 12:12 PM

To: Jeff King
Subject: RE: Sewer Contractors

Hi Jeff,

Happy New Year. Hope you enjoyed the holiday. I'm looking for some contact information on what the
final bill was for the sewer repair and who I can talk to about the assessment.

Thanks,

Marc Kolek

mkolek@hotmail.com
330-232-3664

From: jking@massillonohio.com

To: mkolek@hotmail.com
Date: Mon, 10 Dec 2012 10:02:34 -0500
Subject: Sewer Contractors

If you have any more question feel free to call. Jeff King 330 830-1722
<1331 Walnut RD SW Sewer Repair Bill.pdf>



